
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

ADM Partners with University of Illinois for Companion Animal 
Research and Development  
DECATUR, Illinois, Feb. 9, 2017 — ADM Animal Nutrition™, a division of Archer Daniels Midland 
Company (NYSE: ADM), has teamed up with the University of Illinois Department of Animal Sciences, 
a renowned leader in animal science and pet nutrition, to further develop and enhance ADM’s portfolio 
of high-quality pet food ingredients and premixes. 
 
In this collaboration, scientists from ADM and the University of Illinois will work together to explore 
alternative ingredient solutions. Most notably, the collaboration will focus on using innovative and 
versatile ingredients such as edible beans, peas, ancient grains, complex proteins, and vegetable-
based omega fatty acids, along with ADM’s ever-expanding portfolio of proprietary ingredients. 
 
Additionally, scientists from both groups will examine ways to enhance companion animals’ overall 
well-being by taking a closer look at ingredients that support immunity and gut health by creating 
favorable conditions for digestion. 
 
“The collaborative work between the Companion Animal Nutrition Program in the Department of Animal 
Sciences at the University of Illinois and ADM aims to generate scholarly projects that will support the 
education of undergraduate and graduate students and to advance the education and dissemination of 
scientific findings and innovative solutions for the pet food industry,” said Dr. Maria R. Cattai de Godoy, 
Assistant Professor in the Companion Animal Nutrition Program at the University of Illinois. “This is a 
synergistic initiative which combines the scientific expertise and research capabilities of our program 
with ADM’s extensive ingredient portfolio to offer nutritional and health benefits for pets.”  

 
“We are thrilled to work with the team of researchers at the University of Illinois,” said Mike Cecava, 
research director at ADM. “Their expertise in the field of companion animal nutrition is unmatched. I 
look forward to our discoveries in 2017.” 

 
For additional information about ADM’s companion animal products visit http://www.adm.com/en-
US/products/feed/Pages/companion_animals.aspx.  
 
About ADM Animal Nutrition™ 
 
ADM Animal Nutrition is a leading manufacturing, nutrition and marketing business offering a wide 
range of innovative products for the animal nutrition market. Known as a global leader in amino acids, 
ADM Animal Nutrition also offers consistent, high-quality feed products, supplements, premixes, 
custom ingredient blends and specialty feed ingredients designed to provide leading-edge solutions, 
enabling our customers to meet and optimize animal health and nutrition goals. Learn more at 
www.ADMAnimalNutrition.com.  

 
About ADM 

For more than a century, the people of Archer Daniels Midland Company (NYSE: ADM) have 
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transformed crops into products that serve the vital needs of a growing world. Today, we’re one of the 
world’s largest agricultural processors and food ingredient providers, with approximately 32,000 
employees serving customers in more than 160 countries. With a global value chain that includes 
approximately 500 crop procurement locations, 250 ingredient manufacturing facilities, 38 innovation 
centers and the world’s premier crop transportation network, we connect the harvest to the home, 
making products for food, animal feed, industrial and energy uses. Learn more at www.adm.com. 
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